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The Board met in due form with the following 
members present:  Frances DuPey, Roosevelt 
Allen, Jr., and Gerry Scheub.  They passed the 
following orders, to wit: 
 

 
There was a moment of silent prayer; the Pledge was given and the Emergency Exit Announcement made. 
 
A courtesy copy of the agenda and notice of this meeting was faxed by Brenda Koselke to the Times in Munster and Crown Point, 
the Post Tribune in Merrillville and Crown Point, WJOB Radio Station, the Star, WLTH Radio Station, Comcast Cable, the Calumet 
Press, Portage Journal News, Pilcher Publishing and the Gary Law, Channel 21 media on the 15

th
 day of March, 2010 at about 

9:00 a.m. 
 
A copy of the meeting notice and agenda was posted at the entrance of the Commissioner’s courtroom on the 15

th
 day of March, 

2010 at about 9:00 a.m. 
 

Order #1 Agenda #5A 
 

In the Matter of Notices/Agenda: Permission to open Bids/Proposals. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the opening of the Bids and Proposals.  Motion passed 3-0. 
 
 
In the Matter of Notices/Agenda: Additions, deletions, and/or corrections to Agenda for a Regular Meeting, read aloud. 
 
 Additions – Item #22A – Agreement between Quest Information Systems and The Board of Commissioners of the County 
of Lake on behalf of Lake County Board of Elections and Registration for Campaign Finance Software Training and Installation 
Services in an amount not to exceed $20,000.00; Item #31B-B – Key no. 45-03-32-452-001.000-024; Item #37A – Amendment to 
the Specification for Property & Casualty Insurance to waive the Bid Security Requirement to be ratified; Item #50A – Check no. 
5328 in the amount of $250.00 concerning Zone Violation Enforcement; Item #52A – Additional funding to House Federal 
Prisoners; Deletions – Number 10 and Number 27; Corrections – None. 
   
  Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to waive the Bid Bond requirement on bids for County Property & Casualty 
Insurance. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #2 Agenda #5B-D 
 

In the Matter of Notices/Agenda: Approval of Additions and Deletions; Approval of Final Agenda for public record. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Additions and Deletions to Agenda for a Regular and ordered 
same to approve the Final Agenda and make it a matter of public record. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #3 Consent Agenda 
 
In the Matter of Consent Agenda (Items #15A, 15B, 15C, 15D, 15E, 15F, 15G, 15H, 40, 53A, 53B, 53C, 53D, 53E, 58, 59A, 59B 
AND 59C). 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the items of the Consent Agenda (Items #15A, 15B, 15C, 15D, 
15E, 15F, 15G, 15H, 40, 53A, 53B, 53C, 53D, 53E, 58, 59A, 59B AND 59C). Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #3 Consent Agenda #15A-H 
 

In the Matter of L C Highway – Certificates of Liability Insurance: A. Smith’s Specialized Heavy Hauling, Inc.; B. Kankakee Valley 
REMC; C. Hessville Plumbing, Inc.; D. The Daltons, Inc.; E. Midwest Underground Technology, Inc.; F. Hecht’s Landscaping, Inc.; 
G. Dyer Construction Company, Inc.; H. Bertocchi Plumbing, Inc.  
                                                                                                                                                                           
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the L C Highway – Certificates of Liability Insurance: A. Smith’s 
Specialized Heavy Hauling, Inc.; B. Kankakee Valley REMC; C. Hessville Plumbing, Inc.; D. The Daltons, Inc.; E. Midwest 
Underground Technology, Inc.; F. Hecht’s Landscaping, Inc.; G. Dyer Construction Company, Inc.; H. Bertocchi Plumbing, Inc. 
Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #3 Consent Agenda #40 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: City of Crown Point, Indiana Certificate of Occupancy from Polet Construction, LLC 
concerning repairs in the Lake County Cafeteria. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve and make a matter of public record the City of Crown Point, 
Indiana Certificate of Occupancy from Polet Construction, LLC concerning repairs in the Lake County Cafeteria. Motion passed 3-
0. 
 

Order #4 Consent Agenda #53A 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: IDEM – Indiana Department of Environmental Management. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve and make a matter of public record the IDEM Permit Applications, 
Air Permit Applications, Notices of Public Comment, Notices of Decision, all of such submitted from the State IDEM. Motion 
passed 3-0. 
 

Order #4 Agenda #53B 
 

In the Matter of Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake: IDEM – Indiana Department of Natural Resources (IDEM). 
 

 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve and make a matter of public record the Indiana Department of 
Natural Resources (Earth Source, Lake County Commissioners (3), Lake County Drainage Board, INDOT (2), ArcelorMittal USA). 
Motion passed 3-0.  
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Order #4 Agenda #53C 
 

In the Matter of Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake: IDEM – Certificates of Liability Insurance. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve and make a matter of public record the IDEM Certificates of 
Liability Insurance (Mediacom Indiana, LLC; Grate Signs, Inc.; Gardner Fire Protection, Inc.; Advance Awnair Corporation; 
Advanced Waste Services/Carriers, Inc.; Ulrich Medical Concepts, Inc.). Motion passed 3-0.  
 

Order #4 Agenda #53D 
 

In the Matter of Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake: IDEM – Continuation Certificates. 
 

Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve and make a matter of public record the IDEM Continuation 
Certificates (Washington International Insurance Company - 03/14/2010 – 03/14/2011) 
 

Order #4 Agenda #53E 
 

In the Matter of Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake: IDEM – Notices of Cancellation. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve and make a matter of public record the IDEM Notices of 
Cancellation (Woodmill Products, Inc.; Highland Associates, Inc.), and ordered same to make a matter of public the IDEM Legal 
Notice of Public Hearing (Crown Point High School Cafeteria). Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #4 Consent Agenda #58 
 

In the Matter of Standard Items: Vendor Qualification Affidavits. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the following Vendor Qualification Affidavits. Motion passed 3-0. 
 
QUEST INFORMATION SYSTEM, INC. 
GEMINUS CORP. 
JONES FISH HATCHERY, INC. 
COKER SERVICE, INC. 
INDIANA RADIATOR SHOP, INC. 
WILDFIRE MANAGEMENT & TRAINING SPECIALIST/STEPHHEN CREECH 
HILTI, INC. 
ELIZABETH A. HOECKER 
MATTHEW JOHN COPPENS 
KEVIN D. PEARL 
COLLIER COUNTY CLERK OF COURTS IN NAPLES, FL. 
LEE COUNTY CLERK OF COURTS IN FORT MEYERS, FL. 
LAKE COUNTY CLERK OF CIRCUIT COURT IN TAVARES, FL. 
CRICKET COMMUNICATIONS, INC. 
TOTAL COURT SERVICES 
CAREN JONES  
RESPIRATORY SLEEP ASSOCIATES, P.C. 
MOBILEX USA. 
 

Order #4 Consent Agenda #59A 
 

In the Matter of Clerk’s Branches Report for the months of November and December, 2009. 
 
 Comes now, Thomas Philpot, Clerk, and files with the Board his report of fees taken in and collected in his office for the 
Months of November & December 2009.  Said report is in the following words and figures, to-wit; and the Board having previously 
duly examined and approved said report, now accepts same and the account of said official duly settled as in report set forth. 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to accept the above Clerk’s Branches Reports of November and December 
2009 as submitted.  Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #4 Consent Agenda #59B 
 
In the Matter of Clerk’s Branches Report for the months of January, 2010. 
 
 Comes now, Thomas Philpot, Clerk, and files with the Board his report of fees taken in and collected in his office for the 
Months of January 2010.  Said report is in the following words and figures, to-wit; and the Board having previously duly examined 
and approved said report, now accepts same and the account of said official duly settled as in report set forth. 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to accept the above Clerk’s Branches Reports of January 2010 as submitted.  
Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #4 Consent Agenda #59C 
 

In the Matter of Treasurer’s Departmental Report for the month of January, 2010. 
 
 Comes now, John Petalas, Lake County Treasurer, and files with the Board his report of fees taken in and collected in his 
office for the Month of January 2010.  Said report is in the following words and figures, to-wit; and the Board having previously duly 
examined and approved said report, now accepts same and the account of said official duly settled as in report set forth. 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to accept the above Treasurer’s Report of January 2010 as submitted.  Motion 
passed 3-0. 
 

Order #5 Agenda #33 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Resolution Honoring Eric Roach – Indiana State Wrestling Champion. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Resolution Honoring Eric Roach – Indiana State Wrestling 
Champion, this Resolution was read aloud and presented to Eric Roach, a Junior at Crown Point High School, by Commissioner 
Scheub. Motion passed 3-0. 
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Order #6 Agenda #34 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Resolution Honoring Jason Tsirtsis – Indiana State Wrestling Champion. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Resolution Honoring Jason Tsirtsis – Indiana State Wrestling 
Champion, this Resolution was read aloud and presented to Jason Tsirtsis, a Sophomore at Crown Point High School, by 
Commissioner Scheub. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #7 Agenda #35 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Resolution Honoring Kyle Ayersman – Indiana State Wrestling Champion. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Resolution Honoring Kyle Ayersman – Indiana State Wrestling 
Champion, this Resolution was read aloud and presented to Kyle Ayersman, a Sophomore at Lake Central High School, by 
Commissioner Scheub. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #8 Agenda #36 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Resolution Honoring Nathan Cleveland – Indiana State Wrestling Champion. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Resolution Honoring Kyle Ayersman – Indiana State Wrestling 
Champion, this Resolution was read aloud and presented to Kyle Ayersman, a Senior at Lake Central High School, by 
Commissioner Scheub. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #8 Agenda #37 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Proclamation Designating Month of March as Developmental Disability Awareness 
Month. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Proclamation Designating Month of March as Developmental 
Disability Awareness Month. Motion passed 3-0. 
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Order #9 Agenda #44 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Request from Abate of Indiana’s Motorcycle Safety Division for the continued use of 
the Lake County Government Center parking lot for motorcycle safety training. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the request from Abate of Indiana’s Motorcycle Safety Division for 
the continued use of the Lake County Government Center parking lot for motorcycle safety training, Glenn Medved present. Motion 
passed 3-0. 
 

Order #10 ADD Agenda #31B-B 
 
In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Auction - Key no. 45-03-32-452-001.000-024 – Minimum Bid $3,000.00. 
 

At this time the President of Board opened this portion of the meeting as a Public Auction. 
 

AUCTION: 
 KEY NO. 45-03-32-452-001.000-024, commonly known as 5539 Indianapolis Blvd, East Chicago, IN 46312 – MINIMUM 

PRICE $3,000.00 

 
 Auction proceeded, by Frances DuPey, with a start of one bidder----sold to: Conrad Whitmore & Blake, Crown Point, IN for 
$3,000.00 
 

Order #11 Agenda #31B-A 
 
In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Auction - Key no. 45-08-29-228-006.000-003 – Minimum Bid $3,000.00. 
 

At this time the President of Board opened this portion of the meeting as a Public Auction. 
 
AUCTION: 
 KEY NO. 45-08-29-228-006.000-003, commonly known as 3775 Garfield St, Gary, IN 46408 – MINIMUM PRICE 
$1,500.00 
 
 Auction proceeded, by Frances DuPey, with a start of two bidders----------sold to: Jim Nowacki, Gary, IN for $10,000.00 
 
 

Order #12 Agenda #31D 
 
In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Resolution to approve properties and set date for Commissioners Tax Sale 
Certificate Auction. 
 
 Comes now before the Board, Donald Guersney of Onyx Electronics, to announce the Date of the Commissioners Tax 
Sale Certificate Auction to be held April 21

st
 and April 22

nd
, 2010 in the Lake County Government Center Auditorium at 10:00am, 

list of properties on website www.onyxelectronics.com. No motion. 
 

Order #13 Agenda #31E 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Final action on voiding bid for Key No. 45-03-36-276-001.000-004. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to void the previous bids on Key No. 45-03-36-276-001.000-004 from the last 
Commissioners Meeting, February 17, 2010. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #14 Agenda #31F 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Notice of Tax Sale Certificate Auction on April 21, 2010 for Key No. 45-03-36-276-
001.000-004 – minimum bid $75,000.00 – Certified Check in the amount of $75,000.00 required to enter auction. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to advertise Notice of Tax Sale Certificate Auction on April 21, 2010 for Key 
No. 45-03-36-276-001.000-004 – minimum bid $75,000.00 – Certified Check in the amount of $75,000.00 required to enter 
auction. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #15 Agenda #24 
 

In the Matter of L C Clerk – Contract with Crowe Horwath, LLP for Title IV-D Analysis Services in an amount not to exceed 
$19,000.00. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the Contract between L C Clerk and Crowe Horwath, LLP for Title 
IV-D Analysis Services in an amount not to exceed $19,000.00. Motion passed 2-1, DuPey abstain. 
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Order #15 Agenda #24 (cont’d) 
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Order #15 Agenda #24 (cont’d) 
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Order #16 Agenda #6 A&B 
 

In the Matter of L C Building Manager – Property Disposal Request on behalf of A. Lake County Clerk; B. Lake County Superior 
Court Room Three. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the L C Building Manager’s request to dispose of property for Lake 
County Clerk and Lake County Superior Court Room Three. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #17 Agenda #7 
 

In the Matter of L C Highway Department – Contract for Waste Disposal Services. 
 
 The Board having previously taken the proposals under advisement for Waste Disposal Services for 2010 does hereby 
accept the recommendation of the Highway Superintendent to award the contract to Allied Waste/ Republic Service of Crown 
Point, IN having submitted the sole and most responsive proposal for the total amount of $784.20/month, upon a motion made by 
Allen, seconded by Scheub. Motion passed 3-0. 
 
LETTER OF RECOMMENDATION 
 
March 17, 2010 
 
Lake County Board of Commissioners 
Lake County Government Center 
2293 N Main Street 
Crown Point, IN 46307 
 
ATTN: Frances DuPey, President 
 
RE: 2010 Waste Disposal Services 
 
Honorable Commissioners: 
 
The Lake County Highway Department reviewed the proposals opened at your meeting of Wednesday February 17, 2010 for 
waste removal for the Crown Point and Lowell Yard. 
 
The following proposals were opened: 
 
  Vendor   Crown Point Yard  Lowell Yard   Total 
Allied Waste/ Republic Service  $379.05   $405.15   $784.20 
Crown Point, IN  
Waste Management   No Bid Received   No Bid Received  No Bid Received  
Portage, IN  
Able Disposal Service   No Bid Received  No Bid Received  No Bid Received 
Chesterton, IN 
 
We reviewed the proposals carefully and recommend the sole and most responsive proposal for waste removal for the 2010 
calendar year to be awarded to Allied Waste/Republic Services who met the specifications. 
 
Respectfully submitted, 
        BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE COUNTY OF LAKE 
         FRANCES DuPEY 
Marcus W. Malczewski       ROOSEVELT ALLEN JR. 
Superintendent        GERRY SCHEUB 
        APPROVED THIS 17

TH
 DAY OF MARCH 2010 

MWM/spz 
Cc: Jill A. Stochel, Assistant Superintendent 
 Duane Alverson, Engineer 
 

Order #18 Agenda #8 
 

In the Matter of L C Highway Department – Addendum #1 for the Replacement of Lake County Bridge #273, Main Street over 
Cedar Creek. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to ratify the approval of the Highway Department’s Addendum #1 for the 
Replacement of Lake County Bridge #273, Main Street over Cedar Creek. Motion passed 3-0. 
(SEE FILE “MARCH 2010” FOR ORIGINAL) 

 
Order #19 Agenda #9E 

 
In the Matter of L C Highway Department – BIDS: Replacement of Lake County Bridge #273, Main Street over Cedar Creek. 

 
 This being the day, time and place for the receiving of bids for the Replacement of Lake County Bridge #273, Main Street 
over Cedar Creek for the Highway Department, the following bids were received: 
 

Wirtz & Yates Construction Inc.    $591,212.11 
Ellas Construction Co., Inc.    $588,161.52 
JCI Bridge Group     $734,881.41  
Dyer Construction Co.     $549,915.51 
The American Group of Constructors   $734,056.00 
Tonn & Blank Construction    $690,907.99 
Grimmer Construction     $765,862.96 
Gariup Construction Co., Inc.    $497,500.00 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to take the above mentioned bids under advisement and refer to the 
Highway for further tabulation and recommendation. Motion passed 3-0. 
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Order #20 Agenda #9A 

 
In the Matter of L C Highway Department – BIDS: Bituminous Materials for Roadway Patching, Bridge Deck and Approach 
Overlays (Delivered and Applied). 
 

This being the day, time and place for the receiving of bids for Bituminous Materials for Roadway Patching, Bridge Deck 
and Approach Overlays (Delivered and Applied) for the Highway Department, the following bids were received: 
 

Rieth-Riley Construction  $368,750.00 
Walsh & Kelly   $685,000.00 
 

Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to take the above mentioned bids under advisement and refer to the Highway 
for further tabulation and recommendation. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #21 Agenda #9B 
 

In the Matter of L C Highway Department – BIDS: Bituminous Materials & Surface Milling (Delivered and Applied). 
 

This being the day, time and place for the receiving of bids for Bituminous Materials & Surface Milling (Delivered and 
Applied) for the Highway Department, the following bids were received: 
 

Rieth-Riley Construction  $1,288,775.00 
Walsh & Kelly   $1,355,400.00 
 

Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to take the above mentioned bids under advisement and refer to the Highway 
for further tabulation and recommendation. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #22 Agenda #9C 
 

In the Matter of L C Highway Department – BIDS: Bituminous Materials & Surface Milling (Picked Up). 
 

This being the day, time and place for the receiving of bids for Bituminous Materials & Surface Milling (Picked Up) for the 
Highway Department, the following bids were received: 
 

Rieth-Riley Construction  $120,750.00 
Walsh & Kelly   $115,500.00 
 

Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to take the above mentioned bids under advisement and refer to the Highway 
for further tabulation and recommendation. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #22 Agenda #9D 
 
In the Matter of L C Highway Department – BIDS: Seal Coat (Chip and Seal). 
 

This being the day, time and place for the receiving of bids for Seal Coat (Chip and Seal) for the Highway Department, the 
following bids were received: 
 

Rieth-Riley Construction  $304,000.00 
 

Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to take the above mentioned bids under advisement and refer to the Highway 
for further tabulation and recommendation. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #23 Agenda #11 
 

In the Matter of L C Highway Department – Dyer Construction Company, Inc. Change Order No. 1 in the amount of $1,774.41 for 
Lake County Bridge No. 64, 101

st
 Avenue over Bull Run Creek. 

 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve L C Highway Department – Dyer Construction Company, Inc. 
Change Order No. 1 in the amount of $1,774.41 for Lake County Bridge No. 64, 101

st
 Avenue over Bull Run Creek, an increase to 

the original amount. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #24 Agenda #12 
 

In the Matter of L C Highway Department – Supplemental Agreement No. 1 with MS Consultants, Inc. for construction inspection 
services for Project STP-9945(), Des No. 0400710, the reconstruction of Lake County Bridge No. 77 located in Lake County , 
Indiana in the amount of $12,416.76. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve Supplemental Agreement No. 1 between L C Highway and MS 
Consultants, Inc. in the amount of $12,416.76 for construction inspection services for Project STP-9945(), Des No. 0400710, the 
reconstruction of Lake County Bridge No. 77 located in Lake County , Indiana. Motion passed 3-0. 
(SEE FILE “MARCH 2010” FOR COPY OF ORIGINAL) 

 
Order #25 Agenda #13 

 
In the Matter of L C Highway – Indiana Department of Transportation Report of Contract Final Inspection and Recommendation for 
Acceptance for Lake County Bridge #77, 205

th
 over Bruce Ditch Contract #B-29775. 

 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the Indiana Department of Transportation Report of Contract Final 
Inspection and Recommendation for Acceptance for Lake County Bridge #77, 205

th
 over Bruce Ditch Contract #B-29775 on behalf 

of the Highway Department. Motion passed 3-0. 
(SEE FILE “MARCH 2010” FOR COPY OF ORIGINAL) 
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Order #26 Agenda #14 
 

In the Matter of L C Highway – County Utility Agreement with the Town of Lowell for intersection of Cline Avenue and Belshaw 
Road, Lake County, Indiana. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the County Utility Agreement with the Town of Lowell for 
intersection of Cline Avenue and Belshaw Road, Lake County, Indiana on behalf of the Highway Department. Motion passed 3-0. 
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Order #27 Agenda #16 
 

In the Matter of L C Sheriff – Approval of Contract with ICU Court Monitoring. 
 
 Commissioner DuPey, states this item is a deletion. Item deleted. NAT. 
 

Order #28 Agenda #17 
 

In the Matter of L C Sheriff – Contract with Prime Coat Coating Systems for the renovation of inmate showers in the new Jail 
Addition, the Medical Unit and Sheriff’s Work Release in the amount of $340,105.00 to comply with the Department of Justice 
Report of December 7, 2009. 

 
 Comes now before the Board, The Sheriff Department with Ken Hall, Regional Manager of Prime Coat Coating Systems 
and Steve Adney, Local Contractor for Prime Coat Coating Systems requesting approval of the Contract with Prime Coat Coating 
Systems for the renovation of inmate showers in the new Jail Addition, the Medical Unit and Sheriff’s Work Release in the amount 
of $340,105.00 to comply with the Department of Justice Report of December 7, 2009. 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the above requested contract contingent that Prime Coat Coating 
Systems of Indiana have a signatory agreement with the Northwest Indiana Building Trade. Motion passed 2-1, DuPey abstain. 
 DuPey announced an amendment, Scheub made an amendment to the motion to include that the Prime Coat Coating 
Systems Contract is approved based upon the Department of Justice approval, Allen seconded the motion. Motion passed 2-1. 
(Item Re-Visited in Order #45) 
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Order #28 Agenda #17 
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Order #28 Agenda #17 
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Order #28 Agenda #17 
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Order #28 Agenda #17 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Order #29 Agenda #18 
 

In the Matter of L C Sheriff – Contract with CorrecTek for an Electronic Medical Records System for the Lake County Jail in the 
amount of $150,080.72 plus an annual technical support and upgrade fee in the amount of $10,800.00 per year for year two and 
year three to comply with the Department of Justice Report of December 7, 2009. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the contract between L C Sheriff and CorrecTek for an Electronic 
Medical Records System for the Lake County Jail in the amount of $150,080.72 plus an annual technical support and upgrade fee 
in the amount of $10,800.00 per year for year two and year three to comply with the Department of Justice Report of December 7, 
2009 subject to the agreement by the Department of Justice. Motion passed with 3 yes votes, 3-0. 
(cont’d) 
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Order #29 Agenda #18(cont’d) 
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Order #29 Agenda #18(cont’d) 
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Order #29 Agenda #18(cont’d) 
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Order #30 Agenda #19 
 

In the Matter of L C Juvenile Court – Request to Rescind Three Service Agreements entered into on February 17, 2010 between 
Word Systems, Inc. and the Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake on behalf of Lake County Juvenile Court. 

 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to defer. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #31 Agenda #20 
 

In the Matter of L C Council – Consulting Contract with Gerald M. Bishop for Attorney Services for the year 2010 in an amount not 
to exceed $40,000.00 at the rate of $90.00 per hour. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Consulting Contract between L C Council and Gerald M. 
Bishop for Attorney Services for the year 2010 in an amount not to exceed $40,000.00 at the rate of $90.00 per hour. Motion 
passed 3-0. 
(SEE FILE “MARCH 2010” FOR COPY OF ORIGINAL) 

 
Order #32 Agenda #21 

 
In the Matter of L C Coroner – Contract with John E. Cavanaugh, M.D., P.C. for Pathologist Services for the year 2010 in an 
amount not to exceed $34,164.00 at the rate of $657.00 per day. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Contract between L C Council and John E. Cavanaugh, M.D., 
P.C. for Pathologist Services for the year 2010 in an amount not to exceed $34,164.00 at the rate of $657.00 per day. Motion 
passed 3-0. 
(SEE FILE “MARCH 2010” FOR COPY OF ORIGINAL) 

 
Order #33 Agenda #22 

 
In the Matter of L C Board of Elections and Registration – Seek Proposals for Moving of the Voting Machines for the May 4, 2010 
Primary Election. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Board of Elections and Registration to seek proposals for the 
Moving of the Voting Machines for the May 4, 2010 Primary Election for the return of proposals by Wednesday, April 21, 2010 in 
the Lake County Auditor’s Office prior to 9:30 A.M. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Ferree Movers   On-Time Distribution 
 

Order #34 ADD Agenda #22A 
  
In the Matter of L C Board of Elections and Registration – Agreement with Quest Information Systems for Campaign Finance 
Software Training and Installation Services in an amount not to exceed $20,000.00. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Agreement between L C Board of Elections and Registration 
and Quest Information Systems in an amount not to exceed $20,000.00 for Campaign Finance Software Training and Installation 
Services. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #35 Agenda #23 
 

In the Matter of L C Auditor – Contract with Crowe Horwath, LLP for the preparation of the Tax Increment Allocation Area Base 
Neutralization calculations, review of exemptions, deductions and abatements for Real Property Parcels, assistance with the 
preparation of the certification of net assessed valuation submitted to the DLGF in an amount not to exceed $30,000.00. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the Contract between L C Auditor and Crowe Horwath, LLP in an 
amount not to exceed $30,000.00 for the preparation of the Tax Increment Allocation Area Base Neutralization calculations, review 
of exemptions, deductions and abatements for Real Property Parcels, and assistance with the preparation of the certification of net 
assessed valuation submitted to the DLGF. Motion passed 3-0. 
(SEE FILE “MARCH 2010” FOR COPY OF ORIGINAL) 

 
Order #36 Agenda #25 

 
In the Matter of L C Cooperative Extension – Amendment #2 to Extension Contractual Services Agreement between Purdue 
University and the Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake on behalf of Lake County Cooperative Extension Service for the 
year 2010 in the amount of $141,290.00. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Amendment #2 to Extension Contractual Services Agreement 
between Purdue University and the Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake on behalf of Lake County Cooperative 
Extension Service for the year 2010 in the amount of $141,290.00. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #37 Agenda #26 
 

In the Matter of L C Plan Commission – Resolution Number 2010-001 – Resolution for Employer Participation in the Pick-Up of 
additional Employee Contributions. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve L C Plan Commission – Resolution Number 2010-001 – Resolution 
for Employer Participation in the Pick-Up of additional Employee Contributions. Motion passed 2-1, DuPey abstain. 
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Order #37 Agenda #26 (cont’d) 
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Order #37 Agenda #26 (cont’d) 
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Order #37 Agenda #26 (cont’d) 

 
 

Order #38 Agenda #28 
 

In the Matter of L C Data Processing – Service Agreement with Service Express, Inc. for hardware maintenance for the year 2010 
in an amount not to exceed $34,572.00 at the rate of $8,643.00 per quarter to be ratified. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to ratify the approval of L C Data Processing – Service Agreement with 
Service Express, Inc. for hardware maintenance for the year 2010 in an amount not to exceed $34,572.00 at the rate of $8,643.00 
per quarter. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #39 Agenda #29 
 

In the Matter of L C Data Processing – Maintenance Agreement with Chester, Inc. for the year 2010 in an amount not to exceed 
$16,125.0 at the rate of $4,031.25 per quarter. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the L C Data Processing – Maintenance Agreement with Chester, 
Inc. for the year 2010 in an amount not to exceed $16,125.0 at the rate of $4,031.25 per quarter. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #40 Agenda #30  
 

In the Matter of L C Data Processing – Consulting Contract with Judge William Longer for Attorney Services for the year 2010 in an 
amount not to exceed $12,000.00 at the rate of $90.00 per hour. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Consulting Contract between L C Data Processing and Judge 
William Longer for Attorney Services for the year 2010 in an amount not to exceed $12,000.00 at the rate of $90.00 per hour. 
Motion passed 2-1, DuPey abstain. 
 

Order #41 Agenda #32A 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: E-9-1-1 – Agreement with Verizon in the amount of $1,035.96. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the Agreement with Verizon in the amount of $1,035.96 on behalf 
of Lake County E911. Motion passed 3-0. 
 
 



Commissioners Court                                        Regular Meeting                              Wednesday, March 17, 2010 

   

Order #41 Agenda #32B 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: E-9-1-1 – Addendum #1 to Enhances 9-1-1 Service Agreement with AT&T in the 
amount of $3,500.00. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the E-9-1-1 – Addendum #1 to Enhances 9-1-1 Service Agreement 
with AT&T in the amount of $3,500.00. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #42 ADD Agenda #37A 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Amendment to the Specification for Property & Casualty Insurance to waive the bid 
security requirement to be ratified. 
 
 The Board resolved this matter in Order #1 while granting permission to open Bids/Proposals. 
 

Order #43 Agenda #38 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Bids for Property & Casualty Insurance. 
 
 This being the day, time and place for the receiving of bids for Property & Casualty Insurance for the L C Board of 
Commissioners, the following bids were submitted: 
 
Arthur J. Gallagher Risk Management Services, Inc.  $161,553.00 
Anton Insurance Agency, Inc.     $289,219.60 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to take the above mentioned bids under advisement for further tabulation and 
recommendation. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #44 Agenda #39 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Contract with The Beat Goes On for the defibrillator program. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the Contract with The Beat Goes On for the defibrillator program. 
Motion passed 3-0. 
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Order #44 Agenda #39 (cont’d) 

 

 



Commissioners Court                                        Regular Meeting                              Wednesday, March 17, 2010 

   

 
Order #45 RE-VISIT Agenda #17 

 
In the Matter of L C Sheriff – Contract with Prime Coat Coating Systems for the renovation of inmate showers in the new Jail 
Addition, the Medical Unit and Sheriff’s Work Release in the amount of $340,105.00 to comply with the Department of Justice 
Report of December 7, 2009. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to make an amendment to the original motion, which is, to make the approval 
of the Prime Coat Coating Systems of Indiana Contract also subject to the Pro-Labor Agreement (PLA) and the Pre-Job 
Conference being held and signatures for all above. Motion passed 3-0.  
(Original Motion in Order #28)  

 
Order #46 Agenda #41 

 
In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Lake Dalecarlia Regional Waste District request for Lake County to be a Co-
Sponsor for the purpose of obtaining a grant through the disaster recovery fund. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve Lake Dalecarlia Regional Waste District’s request for Lake County 
to be a Co-Sponsor for the purpose of obtaining a grant through the disaster recovery fund. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #47 Agenda #42 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Letter from Municipal Real Estate Advisors, Inc. concerning records destruction at 
Westwind Manor. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to rescind action taken at the meeting of February 17, 2010. Motion passed 3-
0. 
 

Order #48 Agenda #43 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Letter from SLG Consulting, LLC concerning records destruction at Westwind 
Manor. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the Letter from SLG Consulting, LLC concerning records 
destruction at Westwind Manor. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #49 Agenda #45 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Letter from McShane’s, Inc. requesting the return of their Cashiers Check No. 
4216563887 in the amount of $15,175.81. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to allow the Cashiers Check No. 4216563887, bid security, in the amount of 
$15,175.81 to be returned to McShane’s, Inc.  
 

LETTER OF REQUEST 
 
February 11, 2010 
 
Lake County Government 
Board of Commissioners 
2293 N Main Street 
Crown Point, IN 46307 
 
Re: Bid Bond Certified Check 
 
McShane’s kindly requests the return of our cashier’s check as the bid bond security deposit sent with the bid in December 2009. Having 
provided the products and services in the past, our record of performance should not require the County to retain this deposit. 
 
If you have any other questions, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
Sincerely, 
        BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE COUNTY OF LAKE 
         FRANCES DuPEY 
Brian H. McShane       Roosevelt Allen Jr. 
President & CEO       Gerry Scheub 
        APPROVED THIS 17

TH
 DAY OF March 2010 

 
 

Order #50 Agenda #46 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Ratification of 2007 Homeland Security Grant Program Memorandum of 
Understanding between the Indiana Department of Homeland Security and the Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake 
providing the Indiana Department of Homeland Security with written consent to retain grant funds for expenditures to be made on 
behalf of the Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake – EDS #C44P-0-209A.  
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve the 2007 Homeland Security Grant Program Memorandum of 
Understanding between the Indiana Department of Homeland Security and the Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake 
providing the Indiana Department of Homeland Security with written consent to retain grant funds for expenditures to be made on 
behalf of the Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake – EDS #C44P-0-209A.  
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Order #50 Agenda #46 (cont’d) 
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Order #51 Agenda #47 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Resolution No. 10-06 of the Board of Commissioners of the County of Lake, Indiana 
approving the Issuance of a First Series of Tax Anticipation Warrants for 2010. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve Resolution No. 10-06, Resolution of the Board of Commissioners 
of the County of Lake, Indiana approving the Issuance of a First Series of Tax Anticipation Warrants for 2010. Motion passed 3-0. 

 
 

Order #51 Agenda #48 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Ordinance No. 1320B – an Ordinance of the County Council of the County of Lake, 
Indiana, authorizing the County of Lake, Indiana to make temporary loans to meet current running expenses for the use of the 
general fund and the parks and Recreation operating fund of the County and the Parks and Recreation Department thereof; 
authorizing the issuance and sale of temporary loan tax anticipation warrants to evidence such loans; and appropriating and 
pledging a sufficient amount of the revenues anticipated to be received in such fund to the punctual payment of such warrants 
including the interest thereon. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the Ordinance No. 1320B – an Ordinance of the County Council of 
the County of Lake, Indiana, authorizing the County of Lake, Indiana to make temporary loans to meet current running expenses 
for the use of the general fund and the parks and Recreation operating fund of the County and the Parks and Recreation 
Department thereof; authorizing the issuance and sale of temporary loan tax anticipation warrants to evidence such loans; and 
appropriating and pledging a sufficient amount of the revenues anticipated to be received in such fund to the punctual payment of 
such warrants including the interest thereon. Motion passed 3-0. 
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Order #51 Agenda #48 (cont’d) 
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Order #51 Agenda #48 (cont’d) 
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Order #51 Agenda #48 (cont’d) 
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Order #51 Agenda #48 (cont’d) 
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Order #51 Agenda #48 (cont’d) 
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Order #52 Agenda #49 
 
In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners: Ordinance No. 1258H-4 – Ordinance amending the Ordinance establishing fees for 
internet access to Lake County Court records, Ordinance No. 1258H. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve Ordinance No. 1258H-4 – Ordinance amending the Ordinance 
establishing fees for internet access to Lake County Court records, Ordinance No. 1258H. Motion passed 3-0. 
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Order #53 Agenda #50 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners – Check No. 5325 in the amount of $250.00 concerning zoning violation 
enforcement. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to make a matter of public record the Check No. 5325 in the amount of 
$250.00 for Zoning Violation (Joseph Irak, Attorney at Law). Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #53 ADD Agenda #50A 
 
In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners – Check No. 5328 in the amount of $250.00 concerning zoning violation 
enforcement. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to make a matter of public record the Check No. 5328 in the amount of 
$250.00 for Zoning Violation (Joseph Irak, Attorney at Law). Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #54 Agenda #51 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners – Letter from the City of Whiting requesting the Tax Sale Certificate for Key No. 45-
03-07-278-025.000-025. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the request of the City of Whiting for the Tax Sale Certificate for 
Key No. 45-03-07-278-025.000-025, commonly known as 1427 John Street, Whiting, Indiana. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #55 Agenda #52 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners – Letter from Kevin C. Smith on behalf of the Hammond Port Authority requesting the 
Tax Sale Certificates for Key No. 45-02-12-300-001.000-023 and Key No. 45-02-24-151-002.000-023. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to defer this Item, and ordered same to have Commissioners’ Attorney send a 
letter to Kevin C. Smith. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #56 Agenda #52A 
 

In the Matter of L C Board of Commissioners – Additional Funding to House Federal Prisoners. 
 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve Additional Funding to House Federal Prisoners. Motion passed 3-
0. 
 

Order #57 Agenda #54A 
 

In the Matter of Standard Items: Review and Approval of the Minutes of Regular Meeting, Wednesday, December 16, 2009. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the L.C. Board of Commissioner’s Minutes of Regular Meeting, 
Wednesday, December 16, 2009. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #57 Agenda #54B 
 

In the Matter of Standard Items: Review and Approval of the Minutes of Regular Meeting, Wednesday, January 20, 2010. 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the L.C. Board of Commissioner’s Minutes of Regular Meeting, 
Wednesday, January 20, 2010. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

Order #58 Agenda #55 
 

In the Matter of In the Matter of Lake County Expense Claims to be allowed Wednesday, March 17, 2010. 
 
 The Board hereby orders Commissioners Allowance of Lake County Expense Claims of Wednesday, March 17, 2010  
to be paid out of the County Treasury upon the Warrant of the County Auditor according to the Lake County Claim Docket on file in 
the Auditor’s Office. 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve and make a matter of public record the Claims and Docket.  Motion 
passed 3-0. 
 

Order #59 Agenda #56 
 

In the Matter of Service Agreements 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to approve the following Service Agreements. Motion passed 3-0. 
 
L C BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS  W/ Pyramid Alarm, Inc. 
L C COUNTY ASSESSOR   W/ Adams Remco 
L C CALUMET TOWNSHIP ASSESSOR W/ Star Disposal Service 
L C CLERK     W/ Ikon Office Solutions 
L C COUNCIL     W/ Chester Technologies, Inc. 
L C ELECTION AND REGISTRATION  W/ McShanes 
L C ELECTION AND REGISTRATION  W/ Chester Technologies, Inc. 
L C PROSECUTOR/CHILD SUPPORT DIV W/ Chester Technologies, Inc. 
L C SURVEYOR    W/ ESRI 
L C SHERIFF/JAIL DEPT   W/ Long Elevator 
L C SHERIFF/JAIL DEPT   W/ Stericycle, Inc. 
L C SHERIFF/JAIL DEPT   W/ Swisslog 
L C SHERIFF/JAIL DEPT   W/ Tee Jay Service Co. 
L C SUPERIOR COURT DIV RM 2  W/ Van Ausdall & Farrar, Inc. 
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Order #60 Agenda #57 
 

In the Matter of Standard Items: Poor Relief Decisions 
 
 Allen made a motion, seconded by Scheub, to make a matter of public record the following Poor Relief Decisions.  
Motion passed 3-0. 
 
Ashley Sutherland  Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Tierra McHenry   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Andrew Jones Jr.  Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Donaray Reed   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Chanel Mangum  Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Sophia Thomas   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Leroy Hunter Jr.   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Fredrika White   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Toneisha Ellison  Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Lawrence Smith   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Victoria Adams   Denied 
Dominique Pointer  Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Carolyn Jones   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Deborah Donis   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Maris Smith   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
LaVetta Littles   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Bernard Goldman  Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Cheri Larresque   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Jubrey Parker   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Kim Brown   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Edna Johnson   Denied 
Gregory Spaun   Denied 
Crystal Pirtle   Denied 
Marvin Jackson   Remanded to township for further consideration and review 
Madeline Hunt   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Ambria Johnson  Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Lawrence Girder  Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Carnaham Guadalupe  Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Artilya Buggs   Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
Zachary Dreams  Denied for appellant’s failure to appear 
April Holmes   Denied 
Kerin Clay   Denied 
Ebony Mason   Denied 
Pamela Mallett   Denied 
Allison Brown   Denied 
Antoinette Steele  Approved on condition 
Nolan Campbell   Approved 
Maria Moore   Approved on condition 
Glen Moore   Approved 
La’Tamala Moore  Approved on condition 
Richard Dean   Approved on condition 
Calvin Kendrix   Approved on condition 
Meghann Ryan   Approved 
LaTisha Hicks   Approved on condition 
Yolanda Collins   Approved 
Elizabeth Owen   Approved 
Jeffrey Morris   Approved on condition 
Shaundra Turner  Approved 
Charles Williams  Approved 
Lola Wells   Approved 
Clarance Neeley  Approved 
Steve Ellis   Approved 
Atha Brown   Approved 
Kyechia Hudson  Approved 
Curtis Tolbert   Approved 
Sharonda Greer   Approved 
Gloria Lewis   Approved 
Harold Green   Approved 
Shanta Homer   Approved on condition 
Jennifer Lacy   Approved 
Elise Greenwood  Approved 
Pamela Rodgers  Approved 
JoAnn Hooker   Approved 
Cynthia Bonner   Approved 
Raven Hering   Approved  
 

Order #61 Agenda #60 
 

In the Matter of Standard Items: Lake County Council Ordinances and Resolutions. 
 
 Scheub made a blanket motion, seconded by Allen, to approve all Ordinances and Resolutions submitted to the Board of 
Commissioners by the Lake County Council. Motion passed 3-0. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Commissioners Court                                        Regular Meeting                              Wednesday, March 17, 2010 

   

Order #61 Agenda #60 (cont’d) 

 

 



Commissioners Court                                        Regular Meeting                              Wednesday, March 17, 2010 

   

Order #61 Agenda #60 (cont’d) 
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Order #62 Agenda #61A 
 

In the Matter of Standard Items: Appointments – A. Certificate of Appointment from the Commissioners meeting of February 17, 
2010. 

 
 Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to approve and make a matter of public record the Certificate of Appointment 
from the Commissioners meeting of February 17, 2010, appointing Nicole Witkowski as a Board Member of the Lake County 
Redevelopment Authority. Motion passed 3-0. 
 

 
 
 

 There being no further business before the Board at this time, Scheub made a motion, seconded by Allen, to adjourn. 
 
 
 
The next Board of Commissioners Meeting will be held on Wednesday, April 21, 2010 at 10:00 A.M. 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
The following officials were Present: 
Attorney John Dull 
Brenda Koselke 
Jim Bennett 
Delvert Cole 
Marcus Malczewski 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
           
          ____________________________________ 
          FRANCES DuPEY, PRESIDENT 
 
 
          ____________________________________ 
          ROOSEVELT ALLEN JR., COMMISSIONER 
 
 
          _____________________________________ 
          GERRY SCHEUB, COMMISSIONER 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
_____________________________________________ 
PEGGY HOLINGA KATONA, LAKE COUNTY AUDITOR 
 
 
 
 
 
 


